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How does the wage commission determine the
going rate for six new workers hired by a new

employer under its jurisdiction? The wage
commission determines the going rate for six new

workers hired by a new employer under its
jurisdiction by averaging the wage rates of all the
existing employers within the jurisdiction. What is

the basic result of the wage commission's method?
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The result of the wage commission's method is that
it lowers the real wage rate for the new workers. For

a new employer in the jurisdiction, the wage
commission sets a low wage rate for this group of
six new workers. Then, it increases this rate by 2%

for each new worker hired, giving the new employer
a higher wage rate. This process is repeated

throughout the jurisdiction, with the result that as
more and more employers are newly subject to the
wage commission's jurisdiction, the real wage rate
for this group of six new workers is lowered. The

wage commission thus lowers the real wage rate for
the new workers by decreasing it after a certain
number of hires, and then increases it again. Its
influence spreads like the water in a duck pond,

beginning with a few employers and ending with the
entire jurisdiction. Define the adjective "ducklike"
and explain its relation to the word "duck." The

phrase "ducklike" means like a duck, because ducks
float or sink very slowly. Describe the process by

which the wage commission sets the wage rates of
the employees in the jurisdiction. The wage

commission sets the wage rate for the six new
workers hired by a new employer. It first determines

how many existing employers there are and how
many of each type of employee is employed in the

jurisdiction. The wage commission then assigns
wages based on the number of employees in each
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employer and on the wage rates of each employer.
Now, if the employer is new, the wage commission
adjusts the wage rate of the six new workers it sets

based on the type of employer, so that the wage
rate of the new workers is still "competitive" with

what the wage commission determines is the going
rate for similar workers in other employers within

the jurisdiction. Define "competitive." "Competent"
means adequate and skillful. "Competitive" means
the same as "competitive." The wage commission

determines the going rate for six new workers hired
by a new employer under its jurisdiction by
averaging the wage rates of all the existing

employers within the jurisdiction. Explain why the
wage commission
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